



Our Ref: 002903/21

Your Ref:

Address Correspondence to: Information Management

Date 05 October 2021

Freedom of Information Act 2000

I write further to your request for information received 31/08/2021.

I note you seek access to the following information:

Adjudication / Traffic Camera offence verification

1. Please provide the product name of the solution used for Adjudication / Camera offence verification.
2. What is the name of the software provider of the solution for the Adjudication / Camera offence verification?
3. What is the Contract term and renewal date?
4. What is the Contract value?

Mobile Traffic Offence Report

5. Please provide the product name of the solution used for Mobile Traffic Offence Report.
6. What is the name of the software provider of the solution for Mobile Traffic Offence?
7. What is the Contract term and renewal date?
8. What is the value of the Contract?

Duty / Resource / Rostering Management

9. Please provide the product name of the solution for Duty / Resource / Rostering Management.
10. What is the name of the software provider of the solution for Duty / Resource / Rostering Management?
11. What is the Contract term and renewal date?
12. What is the value of the Contract?

Following receipt of your request, searches were conducted within Leicestershire Police to locate information relevant to your request.

Your request for information has now been considered and the information asked for is as follows: -

Adjudication / Traffic Camera offence verification

1. Please provide the product name of the solution used for Adjudication / Camera offence verification.

EROS Core

2. What is the name of the software provider of the solution for the Adjudication / Camera offence verification?

Cubic Transportation Systems LTD

3. What is the Contract term and renewal date?

3 years Renewal 31st March 2024

4. What is the Contract value?

£40,940.20 + VAT

Leicestershire Police do not hold information relating to contracts for Traffic Offence reports

Duty / Resource / Rostering Management

9. Please provide the product name of the solution for Duty / Resource / Rostering Management.

Origin HR (Duty Management System)

10. What is the name of the software provider of the solution for Duty / Resource / Rostering Management?

Capita

11. What is the Contract term and renewal date?

4 years 9 months contract up to 31st December 2023 – then rolling year on year.

12. What is the value of the Contract?

HR Gateway part of Leicestershire Police is a collaboration with Derbyshire Police and Derbyshire are the IT and Procurement leads for this system and you would need to contact Derbyshire Police. Leicestershire Police do not hold a copy of the contract.

Leicestershire Police provides you the right to ask for a re-examination of your request under its review procedure. Letters should be addressed to Information Manager, Corporate Services Department at the above address. If you decide to request such a review and having followed the Force's full process you are still dissatisfied, then you have the right to direct your comments to the Information Commissioner who will give it consideration.

Freedom of Information Officer
Leicestershire Police

Leicestershire Police in complying with their statutory duty under sections 1 and 11 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to release the enclosed information will not breach the Copyright, Designs and Patents Act 1988. However, the rights of the copyright owner of the enclosed information will continue to be protected by law.

Applications for the copyright owner's written permission to reproduce any part of the attached information should be addressed to The Information Manager, Leicestershire Police Headquarters, St. Johns, Enderby, Leicester LE19 2BX.